

NACPA Bid #17-10 Fuels & Fueling Systems

OPTION #1	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Fuels @ Retail Stores using a Credit Card/ATM Style Card (Option 1)	McPherson Oil
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.199
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.199
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.199
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.199
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.199
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.199
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.199
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.199
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.199
ETHANOL E85	\$0.199
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.199
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.199
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.199
LP GAS	No Bid

OPTION #2	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Delivery of Fuels to NACPA Member Owned Tanks with Vendor's Card System Less than 1000 gallons (Option 2)	McPherson Oil
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.459
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.459
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.459
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.459
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.459
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.459
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.459
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.459
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.459
ETHANOL E85	\$0.459
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.459
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.459
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.459
LP GAS	No Bid

	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Delivery of Fuels to NACPA Member Owned Tanks with Vendor's Card System greater than 1,000 but less than 5,000 gallons (Option 2)	McPherson Oil
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.259
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.259
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.259
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.259
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.259
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.259
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.259
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.259
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.259
ETHANOL E85	\$0.259
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.259
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.259
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.259
LP GAS	No Bid

	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Delivery of Fuels to NACPA Member Owned Tanks with Vendor's Card System greater than 5,000 gallons (Option 2)	McPherson Oil
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.189
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.189
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.189
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.189
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.189
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.189
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.189
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.189
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.189
ETHANOL E85	\$0.189
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.189
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.189
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.189
LP GAS	
Lease Purchase of Card Reader with Installation (to be divided by 36 months)	Total Monthly Cost: \$275.00
OPTION #3	
	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Bulk Delivery of Fuels to NACPA Member Owned Tanks Less than 1000 gallons (Option 3)	Byrom Petroleum
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.22
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.22
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.22
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.22
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.22
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.22
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.22
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.22
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.22
ETHANOL E85	\$0.22
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.22
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.22
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.22
LP GAS	No Bid
	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Bulk Delivery of Fuels to NACPA Member Owned Tanks greater than 1,000 but less than 5,000 gallons (Option 3)	Petroleum Traders
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.145
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.145
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.145
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.145
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.145
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.145
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.145
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.145
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.145
ETHANOL E85	\$0.145
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.145
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.145
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.145

LP GAS	No Bid
	Cost (cents) per US gallon over OPIS or Other
Bulk Delivery of Fuels to NACPA Member Owned Tanks greater than 5,000 gallons (Option 3)	Petroleum Traders
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.0558
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.0608
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (NO OR < 10% ETHANOL)	\$0.1008
REGULAR UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.0558
MID-GRADE UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.0558
PREMIUM UNLEADED GAS (10% ETHANOL)	\$0.0558
DIESEL #2 (ULS) (CLEAR, NOT RED-DYED)	\$0.0481
UL DIESEL FUEL	\$0.0481
OFF ROAD DIESEL FUEL	\$0.0481
ETHANOL E85	\$0.0985
BIO-DIESEL 5% BLEND	\$0.0781
BIO-DIESEL 10% BLEND	\$0.0951
BIO-DIESEL 20% BLEND	\$0.0581
LP GAS	No Bid

Contacts:

McPherson Oil

Ryan Harrison 205-661-4527

Chris Creel 404-962-8821

Petroleum Traders

Gayle Newton 800-348-3705 option 4

Byrom Petroleum

Buzzy Byrom 256-929-3068