

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

**Landers McLarty**

**Woody Anderson**

**1** Automobile, Full Size Rear Wheel Drive  
Four (4) Door Sedan

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 114.7" Minimum 210" length

**Model Year:** 2017 No Bid

V8 Engine

**Brand:** Dodge

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Model:** Charger

Cruise Control

Tilt Wheel

**Price:** \$27,067.00

AM/FM Stereo

**Exceptions:**

Automatic Transmission

**2** Automobile, Full Size Front Wheel Drive

Four (4) Door Sedan

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 110.5" Minimum

**Model Year:** No Bid 2017

V6 Engine 3.4L

**Brand:** Ford

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Model:** Taurus SE

Automatic Transmission

Cruise Control

**Price:** \$20,979.00

Tilt Wheel

**Exceptions:**

AM/FM Stereo

**3** Automobile, Upper Mid-Size

Four (4) Door Sedan

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 112" Minimum

**Model Year:** 2017 2018

V6 Engine 2.7L

**Brand:** Chrysler Fusion S

Automatic Transmission

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Model:** 300

Cruise & Tilt

**Price:** \$27,681.00 \$17,240.00

AM/FM Stereo

**Exceptions:** No V6 Available

**4** Automobile, Mid-Size

Four (4) Door Sedan

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 107" Minimum

**Model Year:** No Bid No Bid

V6 Engine

**Brand:**

Automatic Transmission

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

**Landers McLarty**

**Woody Anderson**

- Air Conditioning
- 4 Wheel ABS Brakes
- Cruise Control
- Tilt Wheel
- AM/FM Stereo

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_  
**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_  
**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**5 Automobile, Compact**

- Four (4) Door Sedan
- Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

- Wheel Base: 102" Minimum
- 4 Cylinder Engine
- Automatic Transmission
- Air Conditioning
- 4 Wheel ABS Brakes
- Cruise Control
- Tilt Wheel
- AM/FM Stereo

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ 2017  
**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Ford  
**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Focus SE  
**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \$14,155.00  
**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**6 Automobile, Mid-Size - 7 passenger**

- Four (4) Door Station Wagon
- Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

- Wheel Base: 112" Minimum
- V6 Engine
- Air Conditioning
- 4 Wheel ABS Brakes
- Automatic Transmission
- Cruise Control
- Tilt Wheel
- AM/FM Stereo

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid  
**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Dodge  
**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Journey SXT  
**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \$21,650.00  
**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**7 Vehicle, Utility-Carryall, Eight (8) Passenger**

- Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

- Wheel Base: 130" Minimum/GVWR: 8600 Min
- V8 Engine
- Air Conditioning Front and Rear
- Automatic Transmission
- 4 Wheel ABS Brakes
- 8 Passenger
- Cruise Control
- Tilt Wheel
- AM/FM Stereo

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid  
**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_  
**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_  
**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_  
**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

**Landers McLarty**

**Woody Anderson**

**8 Vehicle, Utility Sports Full Size**

Four (4) Door

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 116" Minimum

V8 Engine

Air Conditioning Front and Rear

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

Cruise Control

Tilt Wheel

AM/FM Stereo

Automatic Transmission

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ 2018

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Dodge \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Durango R/T \_\_\_\_\_ Expedition

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \$33,116.00 \_\_\_\_\_ \$33,750.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**9 Vehicle, Utility 4x2**

Four (4) Door

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: Minimum of 113"

V8 Engine

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

Cruise Control

Tilt Wheel

Automatic Transmission/W/OD

Limited Slip Rear Axle

ATV Tires W/ Full Size Spare

Roof Rack

Power Remote Mirrors

Keyless Remote Entry

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**10 Vehicle, Utility 4x2**

(4) Door

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: Minimum of 113"

Inline 6 or V6 Engine

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

Cruise Control

Tilt Wheel

Automatic Transmission/W/OD

Limited Slip Rear Axle

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ 2017

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Jeep \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Grand Cherokee Laredo \_\_\_\_\_ Explorer Base

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \$27,160.00 \_\_\_\_\_ \$24,969.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Landers McLarty	Woody Anderson
	ATV Tires W/ Full Size Spare		
	Roof Rack		
	Power Remote Mirrors		
	Keyless Remote Entry		
11	Vehicle, Mid-Size Sports Utility		
	Four (4) Door		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	Wheelbase: 103" minimum	Model Year: 2017	2017
	V6 Engine	Brand: Jeep	Ford
	Air Conditioning	Model: Cherokee	Escape
	Automatic Transmission	Price: \$21,649.00	\$18,735.00
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes	Exceptions:	V6 Not Available
	Cruise Control		
	Tilt Wheel		
	AM/FM Stereo		
12	Truck, Mid-Size, Pickup, 6' Smooth Side Body		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	Wheel Base: 108.3" Minimum	Model Year: No Bid	No Bid
	4 Cylinder Engine	Brand:	
	Air Conditioning	Model:	
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes	Price:	
	AM/FM Stereo	Exceptions:	
	Automatic Transmission		
13	Truck, Mid-Size, Pickup, 6' Smooth Side Body		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	Wheel Base: 108.3" Minimum	Model Year: No Bid	No Bid
	6 Cylinder Engine	Brand:	
	Air Conditioning	Model:	
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes	Price:	
	AM/FM Stereo	Exceptions:	
	Automatic Transmission		
14	Truck, Mid-Size, Pickup 5.5 Smooth Side Body		
	Four (4) Door		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	Wheel Base: 131" Minimum	Model Year: No Bid	No Bid

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Landers McLarty	Woody Anderson
	V6 Engine		
	Air Conditioning		
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	Automatic Transmission		
		<b>Brand:</b>	_____
		<b>Model:</b>	_____
		<b>Price:</b>	_____
		<b>Exceptions:</b>	_____
<b>15</b>	Truck, Mid-Size Pickup, Extended Cab 6' Smooth Side Body		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	Wheel Base: 122.9" Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b>	No Bid No Bid
	4cyl Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b>	_____
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	AM/FM Stereo	<b>Model:</b>	_____
	Automatic Transmission	<b>Price:</b>	_____
		<b>Exceptions:</b>	_____
<b>16</b>	Truck, Full Size ½ Ton 4x2 P/U		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 6000 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b>	2017 2018
	V6 Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b>	Ram Ford
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	SWB(Short Wheel Base)	<b>Model:</b>	1500 V6 F-150 XL
	AM/FM Stereo	<b>Price:</b>	\$18,443.00 \$19,460.00
	Automatic Transmission	<b>Exceptions:</b>	_____
<b>17</b>	Truck, Full Size 4x2" ½ Ton Pickup		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 6000 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b>	2017 2018
	V8 Engine		
	Short Wheel Base	<b>Brand:</b>	Ram Ford
	6.5 Smooth Body		
	H/D Step Rear Bumper		
	Vinyl Seats & Insulated Headliners		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Model:</b>	1500 V8 F-150 XL
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes	<b>Price:</b>	\$20,258.00 \$20,991.00
	SWB(Short Wheel Base)	<b>Exceptions:</b>	_____
	AM/FM Stereo		
	Automatic Transmission		
<b>18</b>	Truck, Full Size 4x2 Extended Cab SWB ½ Ton Pickup		

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Landers McLarty	Woody Anderson
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 6000 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b> 2017	2018
	V8 Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b> Ram	Ford
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	SWB(Short Wheel Base)	<b>Model:</b> 1500 V8 Quad Cab	F 150 XL Super Cab
	Four (4) Doors	<b>Price:</b> \$21,095.00	<b>\$19,191.00</b>
	AM/FM Stereo		
	Automatic Transmission	<b>Exceptions:</b>	
<b>19</b>	Truck, Full Size 4x4 ½ Ton" Pickup SWB		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 6000 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b> 2017	2018
	V8 Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b> Ram	Ford
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	SWB(Short Wheel Base)	<b>Model:</b> 1500 V8 4x4	F 150 Reg Cab 4x4
	Automatic Transmission	<b>Price:</b> \$21,681.00	\$24,891.00
		<b>Exceptions:</b>	
<b>20</b>	Truck, Full Size 4x4 Extended Cab" SWB ½ Ton Pickup, Four (4) Doors		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 6250 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b> 2017	2018
	V8 Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b> Ram	Ford
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	SWB(Short Wheel Base)	<b>Model:</b> 1500 4x4 Quad	F 150 Super Cab 4x4
	All Terrain AKA On & Off Road Tires	<b>Price:</b> \$24,532.00	\$25,824.00
	AM/FM Stereo		
	Automatic Transmission	<b>Exceptions:</b>	
<b>21</b>	Truck, Full Size ¾ Ton Pickup Long Wheel Base		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 8600 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b> 2017	2017
	V8 Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b> Ram	Ford
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	AM/FM Stereo	<b>Model:</b> 2500	F 250 XL
	Automatic Transmission	<b>Price:</b> \$21,153.00	\$21,799.00

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

**Landers McLarty**

**Woody Anderson**

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**22 Truck, Full Size Extended Cab ¾ Ton Pickup Long Wheel Base 8 ft Cargo, Three (3) or More Doors**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 8800 Minimum

V8 Engine

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

AM/FM Stereo

Automatic Transmission

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ 2017

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Ram \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2500 Crew \_\_\_\_\_ F 250 Super Cab XL

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ **\$24,270.00** \_\_\_\_\_ \$25,184.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**23 Truck Full Size ½ ton 4X2 (4) Door Crew Cab Pickup**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

V8 Engine

Air Conditioning

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

Automatic Transmission

AM/FM Stereo Radio

Wheel Base: 139" Minimum

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ 2018

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Ram \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ 1500 Crew \_\_\_\_\_ F 150

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ **\$25,083.00** \_\_\_\_\_ \$25,184.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**24 Truck Full Size ¾ ton 4X2 (4) Door Heavy Duty Crew Cab Pickup**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Wheel Base 153"

GVWR: 8600 Minimum

V8 Engine

Automatic Transmission

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

AM/FM Stereo Radio

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ 2017

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Ram \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2500 Crew \_\_\_\_\_ F 250 Crew Cab

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ **\$24,099.00** \_\_\_\_\_ \$24,754.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**25 Vehicle 2 Passenger Mini Cargo Van**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

Front Wheel Drive

Wheel Base 120"

V6 Engine 3.9 Liter

Air Conditioning

Tilt Wheel

Glass all around

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ 2018

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ \_\_\_\_\_ Transit Connect

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \_\_\_\_\_ **\$21,649.00**

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

**Landers McLarty**

**Woody Anderson**

Power Windows and Door Locks  
4 Wheel ABS Brakes  
AM/FM Stereo  
Automatic Transmission

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**26 Van, Cargo 2 Passenger LWB**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 6050 Minimum

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid

V8 Engine

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_

Air Conditioning

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_

Cruise Control

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

Tilt Wheel

AM/FM Stereo

Automatic Transmission

**27 Van, Cargo 2 Passenger Seats LWB**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 6050 Minimum

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ 2018

V6 Engine

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

Air Conditioning

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Transit

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \$21,993.00

AM/FM Stereo

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

Automatic Transmission

**28 Van, Full Size 15 Passenger LWB**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 9300 Minimum

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ 2018

V8 Engine

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Ford

Air Conditioning

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Transit 350

Rear Air Conditioning

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ \$28,361.00

4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

Cruise Control

Tilt Wheel

AM/FM Stereo

Automatic Transmission

**29 Van, Full Size 8 Passenger, LWB**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 8600 Minimum

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid \_\_\_\_\_ 2018

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Landers McLarty	Woody Anderson
	V8 Engine		
	Air Conditioning		
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes		
	Cruise Control		
	Tilt Wheel		
	AM/FM Stereo		
	Automatic Transmission		
		<b>Brand:</b>	Ford
		<b>Model:</b>	Transit Wagon
		<b>Price:</b>	\$23,878.00
		<b>Exceptions:</b>	
<b>30</b>	Van, Full Size 12 Passenger LWB		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 8600 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b>	No Bid 2018
	V8 Engine		
	Air Conditioning	<b>Brand:</b>	Ford
	Rear Air Conditioning		
	4 Wheel ABS Brakes	<b>Model:</b>	Transit Wagon
	Cruise Control	<b>Price:</b>	\$27,086.00
	Tilt Wheel	<b>Exceptions:</b>	No V8 Available
	AM/FM Stereo		
	Automatic Transmission		
<b>31</b>	Van, Commercial		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Features And/Or Options:		
	138" wheelbase	<b>Model Year:</b>	2017 2018
	V8 Liter 5.4		
	4 Speed automatic transmission with overdrive	<b>Brand:</b>	Promaster Ford
	Air Conditioning		
	AM/FM Radio		
	Power Brakes Anti-Lock Rear	<b>Model:</b>	1500 Transit Van
	Power Steering	<b>Price:</b>	\$21,445.00 \$22,980.00
	Manual door and window (Quote power as an option)	<b>Exceptions:</b>	
	Swing out side and rear doors/glass		
	35 gallon gas tank		
	GVWR: 8600 Minimum		
	Backup warning signal		
<b>32</b>	Chassis Truck, Standard Cab		
	Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Specifications, Features And/Or Options:		
	GVWR: 11,000 Minimum	<b>Model Year:</b>	2017 2017
	Air Conditioning		
	Spare Tire and Wheel	<b>Brand:</b>	Ram Ford
	Trailer Towing Mirrors		

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

Wheelbase 130" to 141"  
 Cab To Axle 60"  
 Single Axle  
 Gas Engine Min 300 Horse Power  
 Dual Rear Wheels  
 4-Wheel Abs Brakes  
 Automatic Transmission

	Landers McLarty	Woody Anderson
<b>Model:</b>	3500 CC	F 350 Chassis Cab
<b>Price:</b>	\$24,739.00	\$24,365.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**33 Chassis Truck, Crew Cab**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Specifications, Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 11,000 Lbs Minimum  
 Wheelbase 176"  
 Cab To Axle 60" Minimum  
 Single Axle  
 Spare Tire And Wheel  
 Gas Engine  
 Dual Rear Wheels  
 4-Wheel Abs Brakes  
 Cab Steps  
 Automatic Transmission

<b>Model Year:</b>	2017	2017
<b>Brand:</b>	Ram	Ford
<b>Model:</b>	3500 CC Crew	F 350 Crew
<b>Price:</b>	\$27,505.00	\$27,708.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**34 Chassis Truck, Standard Cab**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Specifications, Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 15,000 Lbs Minimum  
 Air Conditioning  
 Cab To Axle 60" Minimum  
 Single Axle  
 Spare Tire And Wheel  
 Gas Engine Min 300 Horse Power  
 Dual Rear Wheel  
 4-Wheel Abs Brakes  
 3-Passenger Seating  
 Cab Steps  
 Automatic Transmission

<b>Model Year:</b>	2017	2017
<b>Brand:</b>	Ram	Ford
<b>Model:</b>	4500 CC	F 450 Chassis
<b>Price:</b>	\$30,263.00	\$30,589.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**35 Chassis Truck, Standard Cab**

Includes All Standard Equipment and the Following Specifications, Features And/Or Options:

GVWR: 17,500 Lbs Minimum  
 Air Conditioning  
 Spare Tire And Wheel  
 Trailer Towing Mirrors

<b>Model Year:</b>	2017	2017
<b>Brand:</b>	Ram	Ford

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

Cab To Axle 60"  
 Single Axle  
 Gas Engine Minimum 300 Horse Power  
 Dual Rear Wheels  
 4-Wheel Abs Brakes  
 Cab Steps  
 Automatic Transmission

	Landers McLarty	Woody Anderson
<b>Model:</b>	5500 CC	F 550 Chassis
<b>Price:</b>	<b>\$30,904.00</b>	\$31,550.00

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**POLICE VEHICLES****36** Automobile, Full Size Rear Wheel Drive

Four (4) Door Police Sedan  
 Includes All Standard Police/Special Service Package Specifications, Equipment and the Following Features  
 And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 110" Minimum  
 V6 Engine  
 Air Conditioning  
 ABS Brakes  
 Tilt Wheel  
 AM/FM Stereo  
 Automatic Transmission

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Dodge \_\_\_\_\_

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Charger \_\_\_\_\_

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ **\$21,897.00** \_\_\_\_\_

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**37** Automobile, Full Size Rear Wheel Drive

Four (4) Door Police Sedan  
 Includes All Standard Police/Special Service Package Specifications, Equipment and the Following Features  
 And/Or Options:

Wheel Base: 114" Minimum  
 V8 Engine  
 Air Conditioning  
 4 Wheel ABS Brakes  
 Cruise Control  
 Tilt Wheel  
 Automatic Transmission  
 Body side molding front and rear

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Dodge \_\_\_\_\_

**Model:** \_\_\_\_\_ Charger \_\_\_\_\_

**Price:** \_\_\_\_\_ **\$22,915.00** \_\_\_\_\_

**Exceptions:** \_\_\_\_\_

**38** Utility Vehicle Full Size 4-door

Includes All Standard Police/Special Service Package Specifications, Equipment and the Following Features  
 And/Or Options:

Wheel base min 116"  
 V8 engine 5.3 (E85)  
 4 Wheel ABS Brakes

**Model Year:** \_\_\_\_\_ 2017 \_\_\_\_\_ No Bid

**Brand:** \_\_\_\_\_ Dodge \_\_\_\_\_

**ITEM # DESCRIPTION**

Air Conditioning  
Cruise control  
Tilt Wheel  
AM/FM Stereo  
Automatic Transmission

**Landers McLarty**

**Woody Anderson**

**Model:** Durango SSV

**Price:** \$27,778.00

**Exceptions:**

**39 Vehicle, Special Service Wagon**

Includes All Standard Police/Special Service Package Specifications, Equipment and the Following Features

And/Or Options:

Wheel Base Min 119"  
3.5 H/D V 6 Engine  
External Coolers  
5 speed automatic transmission  
4 wheel disc brakes with traction control  
18 inch wheels  
Police performance electronic stability control  
Am/FM Stereo Radio  
Heavy Duty cloth front bucket seats  
Vinyl rear bench seat  
Police interface Equip module  
Air Conditioning  
Power door locks and windows

**Model Year:** No Bid No Bid

**Brand:**

**Model:**

**Price:**

**Exceptions:**

**40 Mid-size Police Utility pursuit rated all-wheel drive**

Includes all standard police package specification Equipment and the following features

And/or options

Wheelbase 112.6  
3.7 liter v6 Engine  
6- Speed automatic transmission  
Air condition  
AM/FM stereo radio  
Rear View camera  
Power door locks, mirrors and windows  
Cruise control  
6-way power driver's seat  
4-wheel anti-lock discs brakes  
18 inch wheel/ full size spare tire

**Model Year:** No Bid 2017

**Brand:** Ford

**Model:** Police Utility Interceptor

**Price:** \$26,097.00

**Exceptions:**