

All items listed shall meet or exceed all applicable standards. You may provide alternate items up to the number of each item listed with differences being increased features or quality.

Law Enforcement Supplies & Equipment	Net Bid Price	
	Gall's	NAFECO
Chain Handcuffs	17.15	34.00
Chain Handcuffs	20.61	49.40
Hinged Handcuffs	17.82	51.21
Hinged Handcuffs	25.68	56.05
Expandable Self Defense Baton	32.43	105.45
Expandable Self Defense Baton	69.74	100.70
Fixed Self Defense Baton	47.84	52.25
Fixed Self Defense Baton	19.47	56.05
Gear Bags/Organizers	25.73	11.40
Gear Bags/Organizers	23.72	22.76

Law Enforcement Supplies & Equipment

	Gall's	NAFECO
Duty Belt Nylon	7.38	28.46
Duty Belt Leather	23.72	34.30
Duty Belt Molded Synthetic	19.73	No Bid
Duty Holster Leather	126.08	No Bid
Duty Holster Molded	119.19	61.47
Duty Holster Nylon	48.95	28.43
Handcuff Case/Pouch	9.13	40.85
Handcuff Case/Pouch	20.03	16.25
Handheld Metal Detector	122.82	No Bid
Walk Thru Metal Detector	2,567.57	No Bid

Law Enforcement Supplies & Equipment

	Gall's	NAFECO
A.N.S.I. 107 Class 2 Traffic Safety Vest	17.31	7.50
A.N.S.I. 207 Traffic Safety Vest	40.69	14.30
Rechargeable Tactical Duty LED Flashlight Full Size	121.14	129.99
Rechargeable Tactical Duty LED Flashlight Mid Size	117.95	127.47
Non Rechargeable Tactical Duty LED Flashlight Full Size	29.53	30.46
Non Rechargeable Tactical Duty LED Flashlight Mid Size	15.91	27.22
Mag-Lite 5-D Cell Flashlight, Black	29.22	34.67
Mini Mag-Lite LED 3-Watt AA-Cell Flashlight	19.26	11.56

For any catalog/website items not listed above the following blanket discount off catalog/website price for Firefighting Department Equipment, Materials and Supplies is

10%

2%