All items listed shall meet or exceed applicable N.F.P.A. standards. You may provide alternate items up to the
number of each item listed with differences being increased features or quality.

Firefighting Equipment & Supplies Net Bid Price

Turnout Gear Gall's NAFECO
COAT 293.11 961.72
PANT 662.16 591.49
Turnout Gear

COAT 223.18 1,165.80
PANT 454.05 632.75
Rubber Fire Fighter Boots 139.19 166.80
Rubber Fire Fighter Boots 145.27 135.60
Leather Fire Fighting Boots 232.43 266.40
Leather Fire Fighting Boots 313.51 323.40
Fire Fighting Gloves 44.78 72.80
Fire Fighting Gloves 53.73 75.05




Firefighting Equipment & Supplies Net Bid Price
Turn Out Suspenders 17.57 26.90
H-Back Padded Turn Out Suspenders 42.81 34.30
Firefighting Hood 40.36 21.38
Firefighting Hood 42.81 34.94
Firefighting Traditional Style Helmet 193.24 307.30
Turnout Gear Bag 22.49 54.28
Suction Hose with Aluminum Couplings 8 feet 3 inch diameter No Bid 487.50
Suction Hose with Aluminum Couplings 10 feet 3 inch diameter No Bid 153.13
Alco-Lite™ Aluminum Pumper-Type Roof Ladder No Bid 325.85
Alco-Lite Aluminum 2-Section Pumper Type Ladder No Bid 696.35




Firefighting Equipment & Supplies Net Bid Price

Pick Head Fire Axe 46.03 72.80
Flat Head Fire Axe 41.07 66.40
Pike Pole 6 feet 46.73 64.80
Pike Pole 12 feet 65.85 108.00
Pike Pole 16 feet No Bid 119.70
5 Ib. Fire Extinguisher Dry Chemical A, B and C class fires No Bid 60.80
10 Ib. Fire Extinguisher Dry Chemical A, B and C class fires No Bid 140.80
20 Ib. Fire Extinguisher Dry Chemical A, B and C class fires No Bid 158.64
For any catalog/website items not listed above the following blanket discount off

catalog/website price for Firefighting Department Equipment, Materials and Supplies is 10% 2%




