

All items listed shall meet or exceed all applicable standards. You may provide alternate items up to the number of each item listed with differences being increased features or quality.

Emergency Medical Equipment & Supplies	Net Bid Price	
	Gall's	NAFECO
Automatic Defibulator AED	1,408.89	1,800.25
Full Rescue CPR/Shock AED	No Bid	No Bid
Disposable Resuscitator	No Bid	19.67
Disposable Resuscitator	20.14	No Bid
Emergency Response Kit & Bag	38.65	235.36
Emergency Response Kit & Bag	No Bid	161.10
Airway Response Kit & Bag	9.61	No Bid
Powder Free Latex Gloves (50 per box)	9.75	19.21
Powder Free Latex Gloves (100 per box)	9.81	17.51

Automatic Defibulator AED	1,408.89	1,800.25
100% nitrile gloves (100 per box)	No Bid	12.83
Certified First Aid Kit (25 persons)	37.76	52.44
Certified First Aid Kit (50 persons)	137.62	87.59
One-piece Seamless Polyethylene Backboard 16" x 72" x 1-3/4"	73.00	170.05
One-piece Seamless Polyethylene Backboard 18" x 72" x 1-3/4"	No Bid	No Bid
Sanitizer Prep Kit	No Bid	No Bid
Sanitizer Prep Kit	8.78	No Bid
Comprehensive Infection Control Kit	No Bid	10.07
Comprehensive Infection Control Kit	4.19	No Bid

For any catalog/website items not listed above the following blanket discount off catalog/website price for Firefighting Department Equipment, Materials and Supplies is