

NACPA Bid #19-01 Oils, Lubricants, & Fluids

Group		Description	1 Quart		Case (12 qt Containers)		5 Gallon Container		55 Gallon Drum		Bulk (min 200 gals)	
			TMC	WH Thomas	TMC	WH Thomas	TMC	WH Thomas	TMC	WH Thomas	TMC	WH Thomas
A - Two-cycle Motor Oil												
	1	Outboard Motor Oil										
	1	Outboard Motor Oil TC-W3	3.03	3.18	36.36	38.16	61.50	56.25	605.00	586.30	11.00	10.66
	2	Chain saw, weed eaters, etc. Motor Oil TC-W3	3.03	3.18	36.36	38.16	61.50	56.25	605.00	586.30	11.00	10.66
	3	Biodegradable bar and chain oil	NO BID	16.50	NO BID	198.00	135.00	NO BID	745.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4	Biodegradable two-cycle motor oil	NO BID	25.28	NO BID	303.36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
B - Motor Oil		Spec Req SynBlend Group 11/Group 111 blend Baseoil										
	SynBlend	1.1 SAE 5W-20 SynBlend	1.42	2.00	22.35	24.00	32.25	27.50	297.00	288.75	5.15	4.75
		1.2 SAE 5W-30 SynBlend	1.42	2.00	22.35	24.00	32.25	27.50	297.00	288.75	5.15	4.75
		1.3 SAE 10W-30 SynBlend	1.42	2.00	22.35	24.00	32.25	31.25	297.00	330.00	5.15	6.00
		1.4 SAE 10W-40 MAG1 SynBlend	2.30	2.00	25.20	24.00	44.75	31.25	423.50	330.00	7.70	6.00
		1.5 SAE 15W-40 Conventional	2.24	2.35	26.88	28.20	37.75	33.75	368.50	357.50	6.20	5.95
	FullSyn	2 Spec Req FullSyn Group 111 Baseoil										
		2.1 SAE 5W-20 FullSyn	2.55	2.00	30.60	24.00	40.75	27.50	401.50	288.75	6.75	4.75
		2.2 SAE 5W-30 FullSyn	2.55	2.00	30.60	24.00	40.75	27.50	401.50	288.75	6.75	4.75
		2.3 SAE 10W-30 MAG1 FullSyn	2.55	2.00	34.20	24.00	56.25	31.25	514.25	330.00	9.75	6.00
		2.4 SAE 5W-40 FullSyn	4.60	2.35	55.20	28.20	76.50	33.75	797.50	357.50	13.98	5.95
	FullSyn	3 Spec Req FullSyn Group IV Baseoil										
		3.1 Mobil1 5W-20 FS	6.90	3.50	20.70	42.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,364.00	459.00	24.80	8.30
		3.2 Mobil1 5W-30 FS	6.90	3.50	20.70	42.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,364.00	478.60	24.80	8.65
	3.3 Mobil1 10W-30 FS	6.90	3.50	20.70	42.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,364.00	478.60	24.80	8.65	
	3.4 Mobil Delvac 1 ESP 15W-40 FS	NO BID	4.00	NO BID	48.00	154.75	67.00	1,647.25	645.00	29.95	11.65	
	4 Heavy Duty Diesel											
	4.1 CK-4 Syn Blend Only	4.04	2.35	48.48	28.20	65.30	33.75	671.55	357.50	11.76	5.95	
	4.2 CK-4 Syn Blend Only	4.04	2.35	48.48	28.20	65.30	33.75	671.55	357.50	11.76	5.95	
C - Hydraulic Oil	1	Hydraulic Oil										
	1.1	ISO 32 AW	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	29.65	26.25	276.65	288.75	4.43	5.00
	1.2	ISO 46 AW	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	30.05	26.25	281.05	288.75	4.51	5.00
	1.3	ISO 68 AW	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	30.35	26.25	284.35	288.75	4.57	5.00
	2	Bio-Degradable										
	2.1	ISO 32 AW	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	136.98	1,075.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

NACPA Bid #19-01 Oils, Lubricants, & Fluids

Group		Description	1 Quart		Case (12 qt Containers)		5 Gallon Container		55 Gallon Drum		Bulk (min 200 gals)	
	1	Green	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	324.50	NO BID	5.90	NO BID
	1.1	DexCool Comp	NO BID	8.50	NO BID	51.00	NO BID	NO BID	308.00	451.00	5.60	NO BID
	1.2	HD ELC	NO BID	10.50	NO BID	63.00	NO BID	NO BID	382.25	555.50	6.95	NO BID
			Tubes (14 oz)		Case (40 tubes)		5 Gallon Container		55 Gallon Drum		120 lb. Keg	
I - Grease	1	Grease										
	1	Tacky Red	1.80	2.19	72.00	87.50	64.75	75.95	720.00	688.00	228.00	264.00
	2	MobilGrease XHP 223	NO BID	2.28	NO BID	91.00	104.65	87.50	NO BID	940.00	343.20	294.00
	3	MobilGrease CMP	2.93	2.28	117.20	91.00	112.35	87.50	1,240.00	960.00	382.80	312.00

10 18 14 25 6 32 19 28 18 26
 67 129
 TMC WH Thomas